
FOG CHASER JACKET
Ed Callender and Andrea Niehuis

Seed Stitch:
(odd number of sts)
Row 1: *K1, p1; rep from *, end k1.
Row 2: *P1, k1; rep from *, end p1.
Rep Rows 1 and 2 for pattern.

Back
Holding 1 strand of each yarn tog, loosely
CO 27 (31, 36) sts. Work seed st for 2
rows. Cont in seed st and at the same time,
inc 1 st each end of needle every 3 rows 3
times—33 (37, 42) sts. Work even until
piece measures 10" (25.5 cm) from beg, or
desired length to armhole, ending with a
WS row. Shape armholes: BO 3 (4, 5) sts
at beg of next 2 rows—27 (29, 32) sts rem.
Dec 1 st each end of needle every other
row 3 times—21 (23, 26) sts rem. Work
even until armholes measure 9 (10, 10)"
(23 [25.5, 25.5] cm), ending with a WS
row. Shape shoulders: BO 3 (3, 4) sts at
beg of next 2 rows, then BO 2 (3, 3) sts at
beg of foll 2 rows—11 (11, 12) sts rem.
Loosely BO rem sts.

Right Front
Holding 1 strand of each yarn tog, loosely

CO 15 (17, 19) sts. Work seed st for 2
rows. Cont in seed st and at the same time,
inc 1 st at side edge (end of RS rows; beg
of WS rows) every 3 rows 3 times—18 (20,
22) sts. Work even until piece measures
same as back to armhole ending with a RS
row. Shape armhole: BO 3 (4, 5) sts at beg
of row (armhole edge)—15 (16, 17) sts
rem. Dec 1 st at armhole, edge every other
row 3 times—12 (13, 14) sts rem. Shape
neck: Beg collar same time as armhole
shaping, work 1 row even. Inc 1 st at front
edge (beg of RS rows; end of WS rows) on
next row, then every third row 4 times
more—17 (18, 19) sts. (For a wider shawl
collar, inc 1 to 2 sts more and work all inc
every other row.) Work even until armhole
measures 9 (10, 10)" (23 [25.5, 25.5] cm),
ending with a RS row. Shape shoulder:
(WS) BO 3 (3, 4) sts at armhole edge once,
then BO 2 (3, 3) sts at armhole edge
once—12 sts rem. Work even in patt for 
5 rows. Back collar short rows: *Beg at
outside collar edge, work to last 4 sts.
Turn, and work next row leaving 4 sts on
needle unworked. Rep from *, working to
last 8 sts, turn, and work next row. Work

FINISHED SIZE 
46 (51, 57)" (117 [129.5, 145] cm)

bust/chest circumference, unbuttoned. Jacket

shown measures 46" (117 cm).

YARN 
Mountain Colors Merino Ribbon (80%

Merino, 20% nylon; 245 yd [225 m]/4 oz)

Ruby River, Mountain Colors Mohair (78%

mohair, 13% wool, 9% nylon; 225 yd

[205m]/4 oz) Ruby River, Mountain Colors

4/8 Wool (100% worsted-spun wool; 1450

yd [1326m]/ 12oz), Ruby River, and Dale of

Norway Kolibri (100% cotton; 114yd

[105m]/50 g), New Wine, 575 (675, 775)

yd (526 [618, 709] m) each.

NEEDLES 
Size 19 (15 mm). Adjust needle size if

necessary to obtain the correct gauge.

NOTIONS 
Tapestry needle; size H/8 (4.75-mm)

crochet hook; two, four, or six 7⁄8"(2.25cm)

buttons (optional).

GAUGE 
6 sts and 9 rows = 4" (10 cm) in seed stitch

with one strand of each yarn held together.
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