(ORIGINAL)

COMPLETE SUMMARY OF GAME STATISTICS—Home Team

Home Team DHID STATE First Downs: (Rush) /8 (Pass) 5 (Pen.) / Total 24 Penalties Against: (No.) 4 (Yards) 27 Own Fumbles: (No.) / (Lost) INT. RETURNS NCAB CODE (Don't FORWARD PASSING TOTAL OFFENSE RECEIVING PUNTING PUNT RETURNS | K.O. RETURNS RUSHING PLAYER Had Inter. Number Yards Touch-Returns Return downs Att. Made Goals Yards Scoring Yards Had Number Kicked Blocked Returns Yards Loss Yards B 7 5 0 111 c 7 50 KREMBLAS 0 19 54 0 CLARK 0 0 SUTHERIN C CISCO 0 c 3 OKULOVICH A 2 90 B 33 CANNAVINO A 10 90 90 D 2 G 3 29 H LE BEAU 9 B 22 0 c 10 80 B 80 TRIVISONNO A 10 80 0 A 8 64 64 B D 15 5 BALLINGER A 1 2 B D HOUSTON 0 4 BALDACCI G MC MURRY D KILGORE C 50 0 SPYCHALSKI A C SA D 0 D 64 57 H2 34 57 7 501112 06649705 1112 E2 220 Opponents NORTHWESTERN First Downs: (Rush) 10 (Pass) 5 (Pen.) 1 Total 16 Penalties Against: (No.) 5 (Yards) 55 Own Fumbles: (No.) 4 (Lost) 3 RUSHING FORWARD PASSING TOTAL OFFENSE RECEIVING INT. RETURNS PUNTING PUNT RETURNS | K.O. RETURNS Enter Here Team Totals

Enter Here Team Totals
From Visiting Team Summary

RUSHING

RUSHING

FORWARD PASSING

TOTAL OFFENSE

RECEIVING

INT. RETURNS

PUNTING

PUNT RETURNS

FORWARD PASSING

Total No. No. Had No. No. Had No. Comp. Inter. Gain Passes

Points

RECEIVING

INT. RETURNS

PUNTING

PUNT RETURNS

No. No. No. No. No. No. No. No. No. Had Kicked Return Re

Date of Game 1/-2-57

Where Played COLUMBUS, OHIO Authenticated by

nd

(For Home Team)

ADDITIONAL HOME TEAM STATISTICS

Official Attendance 79.635	Score by Quarters:	lst	2nd	3rd	4th	Total
United Attendance 7 (5 C) FA D	OSU	6	14	13	14	47
Official Attendance 79, 635 Weather Conditions 65, CLEAR	NOR.	0	0	0	6	6

PRINCIPAL INDIVIDUAL PLAYS

List below all scoring plays. List non-scoring plays (except kickoffs) gaining 50 yards or more each, including punts. Under "type of play" Indicate rushing, forward pass, interception runback, punt runback, kickoff runback, punt or field goal. Listing of forward pass play should give passer's name first, then receiver, and combined yardage of pass and run. Measure runbacks only from goal line, if started in end zone, as yardage carried in own end zone is of no value to team. All other plays are measured from line of scrimmage (see Official Rules at right).

RUSH	Player or Players CLARK	Team	Yards Scored?
RUSH	CLARK	050	7 YES
PASS	KREMBLAS-CLARK	OSU	5 YES
RUSH	LE BEAU	050	& YES
RUSH	CLARK	050/	28 YES
PASS	KREMBLAS-HOUSTON	950	51 YES
RUSH	TRIVISONNO	1050	2 YES
1 2 36 12			
1			
			7.71.37
niet 6		Au Louis li	in Lage mile
CODE 2 WAT	AYER TODAY THE THE NATIONAL TODAY	No. 1 15.94	D PASSITION SCORES

ONLEHEN

CONDENSED RULES FOR RECORDING FOOTBALL STATISTICS*

(Issued by the N.C.A.A. Football Rules Committee's Sub-committee on Football Statistics)

SECTION 1-FIRST DOWNS.

A first down shall be recorded whenever the yardsticks are ordered forward by the officials, and when a touchdown is scored from scrimmage (by rushing or passing) within a series of downs starting 10 yards or more from the goal line. A first down is not recorded on a touchdown runback, regardless of the distance of the scoring run.

SECTION 2-RUSHING.

Article 1: All offensive running plays are to be classified as rushing plays, not as "plays from scrimmage," since any play begun with a snapback from center actually is a play from scrimmage.

Article 2: Rushing yardage is measured from the line of scrimmage to the point where the ball is declared dead, or is recovered by opponents in the case of a fumble.

Article 3: The rushing total is a not figure. All rushing losses must be recorded so as to account for the net figure.

Article 4: All gains on lateral passes which originated or grew out of a rushing play are included in rushing yardage. (See Article 1 of Section 4.)

SECTION 3-FORWARD PASSING.

Article 1: Forward passing gains or losses are measured from the scrimmage line to the point where the ball is declared dead (or is recovered by opponents in the case of a fumble), so as to include both length of pass and running advance after completion. All yards gained or lost on each completed pass play are credited to both the passer and the receiver.

Article 2: Loss from a completed forward pass which did not advance the ball to the scrimmage line is a yardage charge against passing gain.

Article 3: Any loss by a player apparently intending to pass, but thrown behind the line of scrimmage, is recorded as a foss by rushing. He is not a passer until he has thrown the ball, and he retains at all times the option of running.

Article 4: Interception returns are measured from the point of interception to the point where the ball is declared dead (or is recovered by opponents in the case of a fumble).

Article 5: There is no pass completed by penalty. A gain through interference on a passing play is a penalty against the defending team.

The passer is not charged with a pass attempt, nor credited with a pass completed or yards gained; nor is the intended receiver (or the player interfered with) credited with a pass caught. The passing team is credited only with a first down by penalty. The defensive (offending) team is charged with a penalty, and the distance from the line of scrimmage to the spot of the penalty, under "yards penalized."

Article 6: The forward passer is charged with a forward pass attempt when a forward pass is ruled intentionally grounded.

SECTION 4-LATERAL PASSING.

Article 1: A lateral pass is always a component part of the ultimate play, whether it precedes or follows that play, since the lateral is merely an extension of the original or ultimate play, in effect.

(Approved Ruling—Player A receives a forward pass for a gain of 10 yards, then throws a lateral pass to Player B, who gains an additional 5 yards. Player A is credited with one pass caught and 10 yards under "receiving". Player B is credited with NO pass caught and with 5 yards under "receiving". Player who threw the forward pass is credited with 15 yards under "forward passing".)

(Approved Ruling—Player A catches punt and returns 10 yards before throwing a lateral pass to Player B, who returns another 5 yards. Player A is credited with one return and 10 yards under "punt returns". Player B is credited with NO return and with 5 yards under "punt returns".)

Article 2: Incomplete lateral passes are scored as fumbles, and yards lost are charged against the player who, in the scorer's opinion, was responsible for the failure of the pass.

Article 3: Intercepted lateral passes are scored as fumbles, the offensive team being charged with a fumble lost.

Article 4: The official scorer rules on whether a completed pass to a flanker or man-in-motion is a forward or a lateral pass. If the latter, the play is recorded under "rushing". If the pass is incomplete, the subsequent action of the officials reveals whether the pass was a forward or a lateral.

SECTION 5-TOTAL OFFENSE.

Article 1: Total offense is the combined result of rushing and forward passing only, since these two are the only methods by which legal advance can be initiated while retaining possession of the ball.

Article 2: Total offense yardage is the total of net gain by rushing and net gain by forward passing. "Receiving" yards gained are not included in total offense.

(Continued on back of Form 347-B)

* See the OFFICIAL FOOTBALL STATISTICIANS' MANUAL for complete rulings and interpretations.

COMPLETE SUMMARY OF GAME STATISTICS-Home Team

13

(QRIGINAL)

COMPLETE SUMMARY OF GAME STATISTICS—Visiting Team

AB			RUSHI	NG	- 4		FORWA	RD PA	SSING		TOTAL O	FFENSE	RE	CEIVING	equid.	INT. R	ETURNS	0100	PUNTING	,	PUNT RE	TURNS	K.O. RE	TURNS	1 THEAT	S	CORING	9	
DE on't	PLAYER	Times Carried	Yards Gain	Yards Loss	Net Gain	No. Att.	No. Comp.	Had Inter.	Net Gain	Scoring Passes	Total Plays	Net Gain	No. Caught	Yards Gain	Scoring Passes	No. Inter	Yards Return	Times Kicked	Yards Kicked	Had Blocked	Number Returns	Yards Return	Number Returns	Yards Return	Touch- downs	P.A.T. Att.	P.A.T. Made	Field Goals	Po
	TALLEY	A4	11	15	(4)	B 2	0	0	0	0	06	(4)	D 0	P Secre	01 72 f	E 2 ³	1925	F	o tro is	10,	G E	藤	н/	16	S				T
	MCKEIVER	A/0	32	10	22	В			-		010	22	08	38	0	E		F4	165	0	G #	#	H/	18	S			in.	
	FOWLER	A 2	21	2	19	В					c 7	19	0/	6	0	E		F			6	78	н3	70	s		100		13
	QUINN	A 8	32	0	32	В			100		cg	32	D AS JA	alfebra.	1 ka 149	E	p	F	1	41.00	G	1	н		SO	1	0	0	1
4	HOLCOMB	A/	0	9	9	B/7	10	2	125	0	9/8	116	D	C RES	storië.	E		F			e	19054	н	- · · . · .	s	10	- 1,2	2. 1.	,
	BURTON	18	72	-	72						c 8	72	02	42	0	E		F			G		н		5/	0	0	0	1
132	JOHNSTON	A3	18	0	18	В			4,	ME	c3	18	02	19	0	E		F	\$19 -0.00	-	e		н		s				
	JOHNSON	A/	4	0	4	В			. (1.50	c /	4	D			E	10	F			6	1 100	H	A 2 1 70	s	1 -			
7	THOMPSON	A3	3	0	3	В	275		38	1.52	c3	3	D	ned the	and the	E	0.11.	F		0.5	G		Н		s				
17.	WILLIAMSON	A	()			В	7		₹		С	7.200	D /	8	0	E	- Agree	F		14	e		н		s				
	ASAD	A		ACT I		В					С	- 1 -	02	12	0	ε		F			G		н		s				T
		Alvisa				В	3.1		4	1650	С	raniad puù feil	D	al result	of asq	E	A2113	F	parint.		G	e, 6	H	12 (2)	s				
	West Co	A				В			14	1	С	1. 01 05	D	gap the	54 O B	E	100 H 250 1100 L	F	a , . .enu.	1-4	G	C4-18	Н	D. ulb	s				
	75 - 3 - 3 - 3 - 3 - 3 - 3	AVA	ÐΧ			В	WY		THE)4 E	С	equousy)	D	g. 0044	g. 14 -	E	NEQ#	F	a.v.		6	(e)) 00	Н	h -sheet	S	late :	Code of	1 245	
11	in of Play	A	at et Pia	4,		В	John		Yards.	5601.0	С	Artigi	D	914.93	porter c	E .	de granti	F 234	tor tra	Len 19"	6	\$12400	н	p	s	10 40			
	er- sen	A	is mud	7) K0:	12 C 1	В			17	1,71	c	na said	D	i it ibe	hall of	E	a date	F	11 11	LOSQ Acts 0	G	3.4.33	H		s	ш	. 00.		
4 10	magains sons is at	A	ke odi Lu tig	VIII.	gt.	В	(1000) 1.500	741.00 2.32	promise.	H & C	С	to Alter	D	u ; på	0 101	E	is - 19	Figure	eye i	,14	e		н		s				79
32 D	or show the post	A	317 H	m), 1 / (5,251	В	plane	Àdu	gión e		С	1 0 [6]	D	Unit 315	10.0	E	20.91	Farm	15 7 1		e		Н		S				
g).p :p	ach, lestuding oun	A	Abo	of bio	h, ju	В	shing	forv	mg b	iss _f lh-	С	1/19	D	gives	Mediant are of	E	10 55	F	10, 00		e	ni,	Н	Live Co.	S º1			1	
S. De	ZW ESS A CHED WAY	A	- scoring	o olean	157	В	877 9	foins	10		С	SION	010	N Chine	a Alph	E	and di	F	91.1	1	6	4	H	9.000	S		,=ı	1:3-1	
47.	TEAM TOTALS	A45	193	36	150	B 19	10	2	5	0	064	282	0/1	125	0	E		F4	165	0	G	HA.	H 5	104	5/	1	0	0	1
c	opponents OHI	2 57	A7	E	Fir	st Do	wns:			(Pass).	5 (Pe			24 CEIVING			s Aga ETURNS	inst:	Science .	41	Yards)_		Own K.O. RE		oles:			(Lost))_
	ter Here Team Totals n Home Team Summary	Times Carried	Yards Gain	Yards Loss	Net Gain	No. Att.	No. Comp.		Net Gain	Scoring Passes		Net Gain	No. Caught		Scoring Passes	No. Inter	Yards Return	Times Kicked	Yards Kicked	Had	Number Returns		Number Returns		Touch- downs		P.A.T.		P
H	HOME TEAM TOTALS	158	397	-11	380	B8	5	0	111	2	966	497	05	111	2	E2	4	F/	22	0	64	57	н 2	34	57	7	5	0	4

NCAB Form No. 347-B [Copyright 1949, The National Collegiate Athletic Bureau, Box 757, Grand Central Station, New York, N. Y.]

(For Home Team)

(For Opponents)

(OVER)

ADDITIONAL VISITING TEAM STATISTICS

HCA8 Form No. 347-9 [Copyright 1747, The National Collegists, Athlette Susan, Box 757, Grand Control St

Official Attendance 79, 635
Weather Conditions 65°, Clear

Score by Quarters:	lst.	2nd	3rd	4th	Total
050	6	14	13	14	17
N. W.	0	0	0	60	6

PRINCIPAL INDIVIDUAL PLAYS

List below all scoring plays. List non-scoring plays (except kickoffs) gaining 50 yards or more each, including punts. Under "type of play" Indicate rushing, forward pass, interception runback, punt runback, kickoff runback, punt or field goal. Listing of forward pass play should give passer's name first, then receiver, and combined yardage of pass and run. Measure runbacks only from goal line, if started in end zone, as yardage carried in own end zone is of no value to team. All other plays are measured from line of scrimmage (see Official Rules at right).

RUSH	BURTON	N, W	Yards Scored?
RUSH	CLARK	OSU	4 yes
RUSH	CLARK	050/	I yes
PASS 3VI	KREMBLAS- CLARK	050	5 yes
RUSH	LEBEAU	OSU	2 yes
RUSH	CLARK 3 0 3	OSU	28 Yes
PASS	KREMBLAS- HOUSTON	OSV	51 yes
RUSH	TRIVISONNO	050	2 yes
1/201613	M 25 172 10 1/2		
110.00	AIR = 1 1 G G G	77.612	- Table 1
# 151W	V VX 10 7 6 35		THE DESCRIPTION PROPERTY.
	N. V.		
		9	
	- 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1	31016	
Del) III	CHURT DAY TON CHIE	THE LIGHT CHILD	PASSING A Mai Scrippia F C 18 Table

CONDENSED RULES FOR RECORDING FOOTBALL STATISTICS*

(Issued by the N.C.A.A. Football Rules Committee's Sub-committee on Football Statistics)

(Continued from back of Form 347-A)

SECTION 6-PUNTS.

Article 1: Punts are measured from the line of scrimmage to the point of ultimate advance, if the ball remains in the field of play or goes out of bounds. (Note—"Ultimate advance" is the point where ball goes out of bounds, is downed, or is recovered by the defense to attempt a runback.)

(Nate—"Ultimate advance" of the punt shall be construed to include also any distance which a receiver of the punt may retreat toward his own goal before attempting to return up field. This interpretation gives greatest benefit to both the punter and the receiver, since excellence of the punt normally is responsible for retreat by the receiver. Thus "minus yards" should NOT be recorded under "punt returns".)

Article 2: When a punt goes over the goal line (a touchback), distance of the punt is measured from the line of scrimmage to the 20-yard line only, since this is the limit of the punt's value to the kicking team.

Article 3: If a receiver muffs a punt and the ball continues toward his goal line, the punt is measured to the point of recovery or ultimate advance, as defined above. If a receiver muffs a punt and the ball bounds back toward the kicker's goal, the punt is measured to the point of the muff (the point of ultimate advance), and the receiver is credited with a punt return and with the yards from the point of the muff to the point of recovery, regardless of which team recovers the fumble.

Article 4: Punts blocked are included in "times kicked", and the yardage of a partially blocked kick is included in "yards kicked". It the ball travels toward the kicker's goal, and is recovered by the blocking (defending) team, the yardage is treated as a punt return by the player who blocked the kick. It the ball travels toward the kicker's goal and is recovered by the kicking team, the yardage is treated as a kick return by the player who blocked the kick, but the blocking team is charged with a fumble lost.

SECTION 7-KICK RETURNS.

Article 1: Only the number of punts and kickoffs which the receiving team actually attempts to return are included under kick returns. (Exception—Blocked kicks which travel toward the kicker's goal. See Article 4 of Section 6.)

Article 2: The return will be measured from the point where the returning player actually gains control of the ball to the point where the ball is declared dead, or is lost by fumble. There are no "minus yards" under kick returns (see note under Article 1 of Section 6).

Article 3: The return of an attempted field goal, which falls short and is returned by the defending team, is treated as a punt return.

SECTION 8-FREE KICKS.

Free kicks are recorded as kickoffs if made from placement, and as punts if the ball is punted. The receiving player is credited with a kickoff return, or a punt return, respectively.

SECTION 9-GOALS FROM THE FIELD.

Successful goals from the field are measured from the scrimmage line to the goal line, plus ten yards, since the goal posts are ten yards behind the goal line. The distance of such kicks is recorded only under "principal individual plays" on the reverse side of the Summary. The distance of a field goal attempt is not recorded under "punting".

SECTION 10-POINTS AFTER TOUCHDOWNS.

Article 1: A player attempting a try-for-point-after-touchdown by kicking is not charged with an attempt when a bad pass from center, or a fumble by the ball holder, precludes an apportunity to kick. Such an unsuccessful attempt is charged to the "team", rather than to any individual player. However, if the ball is momentarily fumbled and then kicked, an attempt is charged to the individual kicker, regardless of the success or failure of the effort.

Article 2: When a try-for-point-after-touchdown by forward passing is successful, the receiver is both charged with the attempt and credited with the point scored. When such a try is unsuccessful, the passer is charged with the attempt.

SECTION 11-SAFETIES.

No individual credit is recorded for any player on either team when a safety is scored. The team benefitting from the score is credited.

SECTION 12-FUMBLES.

On any play terminated by a fumble, the yards involved to the point of recovery are credited or charged to the player who fumbled, regardless of which team recovers the fumble.

(Approved Ruling—On rushing play, ball carrier of Team A fumbles at the line of scrimmage and the ball travels 5 yards toward Team B goal line, before it is recovered by Team B. Player of Team A who fumbled is credited with rushing gain of 5 yards, and Team A is charged with a fumble lost.)

WILD PASS FROM CENTER.

Any loss resulting from an obvious wild pass from center is charged to "center pass", and not to any individual player.

* See the OFFICIAL FOOTBALL STATISTICIANS' MANUAL for complete rulings and interpretations.