AS INTRODUCED IN Lok SaBHA

Bill No. 225 of 2017

THE HIGH COURT AND SUPREME COURT JUDGES
(SALARIESAND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE)
AMENDMENT BILL, 2017

A

BILL

further to amend the High Court Judges (Salaries and Conditions of Service) Act, 1954 and
the Supreme Court Judges (Salaries and Conditions of Service) Act, 1958.

Beit enacted by Parliament in the Sixty-eighth Year of the Republic of Indiaasfollows—

CHAPTER|
PrRELIMINARY
1. (1) ThisAct may be called the High Court and Supreme Court Judges (Salariesand ~ Short title and
5 Conditionsof Service) Amendment Act, 2017. commencement.

(2) Sections 2, 5, 6 and 9 shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1st day of
January, 2016. Sections 3 and 7 shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1st day of
July, 2017. Sections 4 and 8 shall be deemed to have come into force on the 22nd day of
September, 2017.



Amendment
of section
13A.

Amendment
of section
22A.

Amendment
of section
22C.

Amendment
of First
Schedule.

Amendment
of section
12A.

CHAPTERII

AMENDMENTS OF THE HiGH CouRT JUDGES (SALARIES AND
ConbiTions oF Service) Act, 1954

2. IntheHigh Court Judges (Salaries and Conditions of Service) Act, 1954 (hereinafter
referred to as the High Court JudgesAct), in section 13A,—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words "ninety thousand rupees per mensem”, the
words "two lakh fifty thousand rupees per mensem" shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words "eighty thousand rupees per mensem", the
words "two lakh twenty-five thousand rupees per mensem” shall be substituted.

3. In section 22A of the High Court Judges Act, for sub-section (2), the following
sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

"(2) Where a Judge does not avail himself of the use of an official residence, he
may be paid every month an alowance equivalent to an amount of twenty-four per
centum of the salary which shall be increased at the rate of—

(a) twenty-seven per centum, when Dearness Allowance crosses twenty-
five per centum; and

(b) thirty per centum, when Dearness Allowance crosses fifty per centum.

4. Inthe High Court JudgesAct, in section 22C, for the words "fifteen thousand" and
"twelve thousand”, the words "thirty-four thousand" and "twenty-seven thousand" shall
respectively be substituted.

5. In the First Schedule to the High Court Judges Act,—
(8) inPart 1, in paragraph 2,—

(A) in clause (a), for the letters and figures "Rs. 43,890", the letters and
figures "Rs. 1,21,575" shall be substituted;

(B) in clause (b), for the letters and figures "Rs. 34,350", the letters and
figures "Rs. 96,524" shall be substituted;

(C) in the proviso, for the letters and figures "Rs. 5,40,000" and
"Rs. 4,80,000", the letters and figures"Rs. 15,00,000" and "Rs. 13,50,000" shall
respectively be substituted;
(b) InPart 111, in paragraph 2,—

(A) in clause (b), for the letters and figures "Rs. 16,020", the letters and
figures "Rs. 45,016" shall be substituted;

(B) intheproviso, for thelettersand figures"Rs. 5,40,000" and " Rs. 4,80,000",
thelettersand figures"Rs. 15,00,000" and "Rs. 13,50,000" shall respectively be
substituted.

CHAPTERI I

AMENDMENTS OF THE SUPREME COURT JUDGES (SALARIES AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE)
Acrt, 1958

6. In the Supreme Court Judges (Salaries and Conditions of Service) Act, 1958
(hereinafter referred to as the Supreme Court JudgesAct), in section 12A,—

(@) in sub-section (1), for the words "one lakh rupees per mensem”, the words
"two lakh eighty thousand rupees per mensem" shall be substituted;

28 of 1954.
5

10

15

20

25

30

35

41 of 1958.
40



10

15

20

25

3

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words "ninety thousand rupees per mensem”, the
words "two lakh fifty thousand rupees per mensem" shall be substituted.

7. In section 23 of the Supreme Court JudgesAct, for sub-section (1A), the following
sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

"(1A) Where aJudge does not avail himself of the use of an officia residence, he
may be paid every month an alowance equivalent to an amount of twenty-four per
centum of the salary which shall be increased at the rate of—

(a) twenty-seven per centum, when Dearness Allowance crosses twenty-
five per centum; and

(b) thirty per centum, when DearnessAllowance crossesfifty per centum.”.

8. In section 23B of the Supreme Court JudgesAct, for the words "twenty thousand"
and "fifteen thousand”, the words "forty-five thousand" and "thirty-four thousand" shall
respectively be substituted.

9. In the Schedule to the Supreme Court Judges Act,—
(8) inPart 1, in paragraph 2,—

(A) in clause (b), for the letters and figures "Rs. 12,180", "Rs. 3,69,300",
and "Rs. 31,030", the letters and figures "Rs. 34,104", "Rs. 10,34,040", and
"Rs. 86,884" shall respectively be substituted;

(B) inthe proviso, for thelettersand figures"Rs. 6,00,000", thelettersand
figures"Rs. 16,80,000" shall be substituted;

(C) inthe proviso to paragraph 3, for the letters and figures " Rs.5,40,000",
the letters and figures "Rs. 15,00,000" shall be substituted;
(b) InPart 111, in paragraph 2,—

(A) in clause (b), for the letters and figures "Rs. 16,020", the letters and
figures "Rs. 45,016" shall be substituted;

(B) in the proviso, for the letters and figures "Rs. 6,00,000" and
"Rs. 5,40,000", the letters and figures"Rs. 16,80,000" and "Rs. 15,00,000" shall
respectively be substituted.

Amendment
of section 23.

Amendment
of section
23B.

Amendment
of the
Schedule.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTSAND REASONS

The salaries, allowances and pensions of the Judges of the Supreme Court and High
Court werelast revised with effect from 1st January, 2006, as per the High Court and Supreme
Court Judges (Saaries and Conditions of Service) Amendment Act, 2009. The Seventh
Central Pay Commission recommended revision in the salaries and pensionary benefits of
the Central Government employees including the members of All India Services. The
Government has accepted the mgjority of the recommendations of the Commission and issued
orders. The revised pension rules have come into force on the 1st day of January, 2016.

2. The need to increase the salaries, alowances and pension of the Judges of the
Supreme Court and the High Courts has been necessitated because of the increase in the
sdaries, alowances and pensions of the Central Government employees on acceptance of
the recommendations of the Seventh Central Pay Commission by the Government.

3. The High Court and Supreme Court Judges (Salaries and Conditions of Service)
Amendment Bill, 2017 seeks to revise the salaries of the Judges with effect from the 1st day
of January, 2016, asfollows.—

Chief Justice of India — fromRs. 1,00,000/- per month to Rs. 2,80,000/- per month
Judges of Supreme Court — from Rs. 90,000/- per month to Rs. 2,50,000/- per month
Chief Justice of High Court — from Rs. 90,000/- per monthto Rs. 2,50,000/- per month
Judges of the High Court — from Rs. 80,000/- per monthto Rs. 2,25,000/- per month

The Bill also seeks to revise the rates of House Rent Allowance with effect from
1st July, 2017 and the rates of sumptuary allowance with effect from 22nd day of
September, 2017.

4. The rates of pension of the Judges of the High Court and the Supreme Court were
last enhanced with effect from the 1st January, 2006 by the High Court and Supreme Court
Judges (Salariesand Conditions of Service) Amendment Act, 2009. The Seventh Central Pay
Commission recommended revision in the pay and pensionary benefits of the Central
Government employeesincluding themembersof theAll IndiaServices. Therevised pension
rules have come into force on the 1st day of January, 2016. It is, therefore, necessary to
increase suitably the existing pension and maximum pension of the Judges of the High
Courts and the Supreme Court.

5. Based on therecommendations of the Seventh Central Pay Commission, the Central
Government has decided to grant additional quantum of pension and family pension with
referenceto the age of the Central Government pensioner and family pensioner. Onthe same
analogy, it has been decided to extend the similar benefit to all retired Judges.

6. The Bill seeks to achieve the above objectives.

New DEeLHI; RAVI SHANKAR PRASAD
The11th December, 2017.

PRESIDENT'S RECOMMENDATION UNDERARTICLE 117 OF THE
CONSTITUTION OF INDIA

[Letter No. L-11017/1/2016-Jus. from Shri Ravi Shankar Prasad, Minister of
Law and Justicetothe Secretary General, Lok Sabha.]

The President, having been informed of the subject matter of the High Court and
Supreme Court Judges (Salaries and Conditions of Service) Amendment Bill, 2017,
recommends the introduction and consideration of the Bill in Lok Sabha under article
117(1) and (3) of the Constitution.



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

The Bill seeks to amend the High Court Judges (Salaries and Conditions of Service)
Act, 1954 and the Supreme Court Judges (Salaries and Conditions of Service) Act, 1958
so as to revise the salaries of the Chief Justice of India, Judges of the Supreme
Court, Chief Justice of High Courts and Judges of High Courts.

2. The Bill also seeksto revise the pension, family pension and sumptuary alowance
of the Judges of the Supreme Court and High Courts.

3. The additional expenditure in respect of the Judges of the High Court is to be
borne by the concerned State Governments under article 290 of the Constitution of India.
The Bill, if enacted and brought into operation, will involve an additional expenditure of
approximately Rs. 20 crore out of which arecurring expenditure of Rs. 12 crore per annum
for payment of salary and Rs. 8 crore as non-recurring expenditure towards arrears of
sdaries, pension and family pension from the Consolidated Fund of India

4. The Bill does not involve any other expenditure of either recurring or non-recurring
nature.



Salaries of the
Judges.

Facility of
rent-free
houses.

Sumptuary
allowance.

ANNEXURE
ExtracTs FRoM THE HigH CourT JUDGES (SALARIES AND CONDITIONS OF SERvICE) AcT, 1954
(280F1954)
* * * * *
CHAPTERIII
SALARIES AND PENSIONS

13A. (1) There shall be paid to the Chief Justice of a High Court, by way of salary,
ninety thousand rupees per mensem.

(2) There shall be paid to aJudge of aHigh Court, by way of salary, eighty thousand
rupees per mensem.

* * * * *
22A. (1)* * * * *

(2) Where aJudge does not avail himself of the use of an official residence, he may be
paid every month an allowance equivalent to an amount to thirty per cent. of the salary.

* * * * *

22C. The Chief Justice and each of the other Judges of every High Court shall be
entitled to asumptuary allowance of fifteen thousand rupees per month and twelve thousand
rupees per month respectively.

* * * * *
THE FIRST SCHEDULE
(See sections 14 and 15)
PeEnsioNs oF JUDGES
Parr |

* * * * *

2. Subject to the other provisions of this Part, the pension payabl e to a Judge to whom
this Part applies for pension shall be,—

(a) for serviceas Chief Justicein any High Court, Rs. 43,890 per annum for each
completed year of service;

(b) for service as any other Judge in any High Court, Rs. 34,350 per annum for
each completed year of service:

Provided that the pension under this paragraph shall in no case exceed Rs. 5,40,000 per
annum in the case of a Chief Justice and Rs. 4,80,000 per annum in the case of any other
Judge.

* * * * *
Part 111
* * * * *

2. The pension payable to such a Judge shall be—

* * * * *

6



7
(b) a specia additional pension of Rs. 16,020 per annum in respect of each
completed year of servicefor pension:

Provided that the pension under clause (a) and the additional pension under clause (b)
together shall in no case exceed Rs. 5,40, 000 per annum in the case of a Chief Justice and
Rs. 4,80,000 per annum in the case of any other Judge.

* * * * *

ExTRACTS FROM THE SUPREME COURT JUDGES (SALARIES AND
ConbiTioNns oF Service) Act, 1958

(41 oF 1958)
* * * * *
CHAPTER 111
SALARIES AND PENSIONS

12A. (1) There shall be paid to the Chief Justice of India, by way of salary, onelakh Saaries of the
rupees per mensem. Judges.

(2) There shall be paid to a Judge of the Supreme Court, by way of salary, ninety
thousand rupees per mensem.

* * * * *
23. (1) * * * * * Facilities for
rent-free
(1A) Where aJudge does not avail himself of the use of an official residence, hemay be  houses and
paid every month an allowance equivalent to an amount of thirty per cent. of the salary. Othzft_ .
conaitions O
* * * * * service.

23B. The Chief Justice and each of the other Judges shall be entitled to a sumptuary  Sumptuary
allowance of twenty thousand rupees per month and fifteen thousand rupees per month  &lowance.
respectively.

* * * * *
THE SCHEDULE
(See sections 13 and 14)
Pensions oF JUDGES

ParT |

* * * * *

2. Subject to the provisions of this Part, the pension payable to a Chief Justice to
whom this Part applies shall be an amount equal to the sum of the following amounts, that is
to say,—

* * * * *

(b) an additional amount of Rs. 12,180 per annum for each completed year of
service as the Chief Justice of the Supreme Court until he has become entitled to a
pension of Rs. 3,69,300 per annum, and thereafter an additional amount of Rs. 31,030
for each completed year of such service:

Provided that the aggregate amount of his pension shall in no case exceed
Rs. 6,00,000 per annum.

3. The pension payable to any other Judge to whom this part applies shall be an
amount equal to the pension which would have been payable to him in accordance with the



8

scale and provisionsin Part | of the First Schedule to the High Court Judges (Conditions
of Service) Act, 1954 (28 of 1954), if his service as a Judge had been rendered as the
Chief Justice of aHigh Court:

Provided that the pension under this paragraph shall in no case exceed Rs. 5,40,000
per annum.

* * * * *
Part 111
* * * * *

2. The pension payable to such a Judge shall be—

* * * * *

(b) a specia additional pension of Rs. 16,020 per annum in respect of each
completed year of service for pension asaJudgein India:

Provided that the pension under clause (a) and the additional pension under clause (b)
together shall in no case exceed Rs. 6,00,000 per annum in the case of a
Chief Justice and Rs. 5,40,000 per annum in the case of any other Judge.



LOK SABHA

A
BILL

further to amend the High Court Judges (Salaries and Conditions of Service) Act, 1954 and
the Supreme Court Judges (Salaries and Conditions of Service) Act, 1958.

(Sri Ravi Shankar Prasad, M.P)

GMGIPMRND—2842L.S(S3)—14-12-2017.




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /All
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Warning
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Tags
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJDFFile false
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams false
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments false
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts true
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /Description <<
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000500044004600206587686353ef901a8fc7684c976262535370673a548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200208fdb884c9ad88d2891cf62535370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef653ef5728684c9762537088686a5f548c002000700072006f006f00660065007200204e0a73725f979ad854c18cea7684521753706548679c300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /FRA <>
    /ITA <>
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020b370c2a4d06cd0d10020d504b9b0d1300020bc0f0020ad50c815ae30c5d0c11c0020ace0d488c9c8b85c0020c778c1c4d560002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken voor kwaliteitsafdrukken op desktopprinters en proofers. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /PTB <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents for quality printing on desktop printers and proofers.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /NoConversion
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /NA
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure true
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles true
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /NA
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


